RE: Invoice for Coalition to Save Small Business

Subject: RE: Invoice for Coalition to Save Small Business
From: "Carol Schatz" <@>

Date: 02/02/2017 09:25 AM

To: sholley@ccala.org

| think this should be split 50/50—there was no formal agreement and Jessica was out of
town.

Carol E. Schatz
President & CEO

https://www.downto\

Downtown Center Business Improvement District
626 Wilshire Blvd., Suite 200 | Los Angeles, CA 90017
Call: 213-416-7534 | Fax: 213-624-0858

Web: DowntownLA.com

From: Suzanne Holley CCA

Sent: Wednesday, February 01, 2017 7:24 PM

To: Carol Schatz

Subject: FW: Invoice for Coalition to Save Small Business

Carol - what was the agreement on this? Was BID going to pay for all or a percentage of
Mecoy? Rodriguez?

Thanks.

Suzanne

From: laura@mecoy.net [mailto:laura@mecoy.net]
Sent: Wednesday, February 01, 2017 1:22 PM

To: Suzanne Holley CCA

Subject: Invoice for Coalition to Save Small Business

Dear Suzanne:

Attached please find the hours worked for the Coalition in January and the bill for
January. The invoice also includes the December bill. If that check is already in the mail,
please disregard. I've just not received it yet. If these bills should be going to the DCBID
instead, please let me know.

| did receive the $2,000 deposit for the Treasures scripts. Thanks so much for that and
for all the other work!
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RE: Invoice for Coalition to Save Small Business

MECOY eLo: Laura Mecoy
- President, Mecoy Communications

P: 310.546.5860 |C: 310.529.7717
laura@mecoy.net | www.mecoy.net
@Imecoy | www.facebook.com/laura.mecoy
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